
Join our team…


Associate Pastor of Discipleship & Worship 

Saugatuck/Douglas, Michigan

POSITION DESCRIPTION 

The Associate Pastor, supported by and reporting to 
the Lead Pastor, leads the church in equipping 
worshiping disciples who make disciples that share 
the life-changing love of Jesus with their neighbors. 


The primary goal of this position is to achieve: life-
giving and growing discipleship pathways for all age 
groups; inspirational worship environments that lead 
to God encounters; a culture of spiritually growing 
relationships that result in intentional and frequent 
next-steps in faith formation.


Key Responsibilities: 
• Disciple. Intentionally guide and pastor people 

through the discipleship pathway helping them to 
experience Jesus dependent lives, Spiritually 
Growing Relationships, Grace Filled Community, 
and Neighbor Serving Disciples.


• Worship. Create inspiring worship environments 
to draw people into God’s presence by exalting 
Christ through the power and presence of the 
Holy Spirit through blended worship practices, 
musicianship, and preaching, using the latest in 
worship technologies. 


• Equip. Fulfills the vision of Ephesians 4 as an 
equipper of the saints for the work of ministry by 
equipping leaders in formal and relational 
environments across the age spectrum.  

A Strong Candidate: 

• Is a committed and mature Christian meeting the 
biblical description of an Elder in the Pastoral 
Epistles and personal faith witness.	 


• has a professional demeanor with above average 
emotional intelligence able to lead through 
influence rather than position or authority. 


• thrives building a team environment and making 
things happen in teams.


• Will have a ministry degree and significant formal 
ministry training. A strong candidate will have a 
Master’s degree or beyond.


• Has a successful track record in family or youth 
discipleship.


• is a self-starter able to flow between team work 
and self-directed work.

Why We’re Excited About This Opportunity 

As Community Church grows, we are also 
reshaping our Equipping Team (staff). We are 
aligning our Equipping Team with our vision and 
intentional disciple-making strategy. Our Equipping 
Team has a mandate from Ephesians 4 to build up 
our church body. Can you imagine a team of trust, 
prayer, encouragement, and effectiveness that is 
living out Jesus Dependent Lives, Spiritually 
Growing Relationships, Grace Filled Community, 
and Neighbor Serving Discipleship? Lead Pastor, 
Brandon Beebe and the Elder Board of Community 
Church is building a team Jesus is rooting for. Are 
you in?


About Community Church 

Community Church of Douglas is a non-
denominational church reaching the lakeshore 
communities of Saugatuck, Douglas, Fennville, 
Holland, South Haven, and Hamilton. 


Community Church is growing as a community 
experiencing and sharing the Kingdom of God more 
and more… sharing the life-changing love of Jesus 
with our neighbors. Drawing from a large 
geographic area, the make-up of community church 
includes a wide range or spiritual, theological, 
socio-economic, and household backgrounds.  Our 
discipleship pathway includes a growing Sunday 
worship community, discipleship teams, community 
groups, and a vibrant community center.


At the core, we are discovering our own living and 
growing relationships with Jesus Christ, and we are 
committed to sharing the life-changing love of 
Jesus with our neighbors. 


TO APPLY: 
Send a resume and cover letter detailing your 
qualifications and reason for interest in the position 
to: brandon@ccofdouglas.org

mailto:brandon@ccofdouglas.org

